

Bid 14- 016 Asphaltic Concrete

Company	Fred Weber		Pace Construction			West
Bidder wishes to be bound by the API as described in the bid Specifications	Yes		Yes			
Feature Description	Price per ton (FOB Plant)		Price per ton (FOB Plant)			
Type BP-1 Mix	\$47.50		\$46.75			No bid
Type BP-2 Mix	\$47.50		\$46.75			No bid
Bituminous Base Mix	\$47.50		\$46.75			No bid
PG 64-22 Minimum tons	\$47.50		\$46.75			No bid
PG 70-22	No bid		\$56.00			No bid
Minimum tons	No bid		550			No bid
PG 76-22	No bid		\$58.00			No bid
Minimum tons	No bid		550			No bid
Cold Mix (per ton)	No bid		No bid			No bid
UPM High Performance Cold Mix or equivalent (per ton)	\$100.00		No bid			\$105.00
UPM Bulk - 400 Ton (per ton)	\$100.00		No bid			\$105.00
			St. Charles	Fort Belle	Moscow Mills	
Delivery charges per ton	Bit Base	BP-1or 2	All mixes	All mixes	All mixes	
Zone 1	\$5.75	\$5.75	\$4.80		\$6.50	
Zone 1a	\$5.75	\$5.75	\$4.70			
Zone 2	\$5.65	\$5.65	\$5.60		\$6.30	
Zone 2 a	\$5.75	\$5.75	\$4.40			
Zone 3	\$5.60	\$5.60	\$5.90		\$6.50	
Zone 3 a	\$5.45	\$5.45	\$4.60			
Zone 4	\$5.65	\$5.65	\$6.20		\$6.80	
Zone 4 a	\$6.00	\$6.00		\$5.70		
Zone 5	\$6.10	\$6.10	\$6.60		\$7.00	
Zone 5 a	\$6.15	\$6.15		\$5.40		
Zone 6	\$6.45	\$6.45	\$7.00		\$6.40	
Zone 6 a	\$6.30	\$6.30		\$5.20		
Zone 7	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$7.10		\$6.90	
Zone 7 a	\$6.60	\$6.60		\$4.60		
Zone 8	\$7.15	\$7.15	\$7.20		\$7.10	
Zone 8 a	\$7.40	\$7.40		\$4.30		
Zone 9	\$7.15	\$7.15	\$7.20		\$6.80	
Zone 9 a	\$7.60	\$7.60		\$4.60		
This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award						