

Bid 14-019

Road Paint, Bridge Paint, and Thermoplastic

Company	Ennis Paint		Swarco Industries		Flint Trading, Inc.	
Stripping Paint	Price per 55 Gallon Drum		Price per 55 Gallon Drum		Price per 55 Gallon Drum	
Acrylic Waterborne (White)	\$486.75		No Bid		No Bid	
Acrylic Waterborne (Yellow)	\$481.25		No Bid		No Bid	
High Build (White)	\$522.50		No Bid		No Bid	
High Build (Yellow)	\$522.50		No Bid		No Bid	
Cold Weather (White)	\$577.50		No Bid		No Bid	
Cold Weather (Yellow)	\$577.50		No Bid		No Bid	
Bridge Paint	Type	Per Gallon	Type	Per Gallon	Type	Per Gallon
Oil Base Primer	NA		No Bid	No bid	No Bid	
Top Coat	NA		No Bid	No bid	No Bid	
New Structure Paint	Type	Per Gallon	Type	Per Gallon	Type	Per Gallon
Primer	NA		No Bid	No bid	NA	
Top Coat	NA		No Bid	No bid	NA	
Existing Structure Paint	Type	Per Gallon	Type	Per Gallon	Type	Per Gallon
Primer	NA		No Bid	No bid	No Bid	
Top Coat	NA		No Bid	No bid	No Bid	
Others	NA		No Bid	No bid	No Bid	
Thermoplastic Symbols	UOM	Price	UOM	Price	UOM	Price
Left Or Right Turn Arrow, 4 Foot, 125 Mil	Ea	NA	Ea	\$60.84	Ea 2 @ per pack	\$45.44
Left Or Right Turn Arrow, 8 Foot, 125 Mil	Ea	NA	Ea	\$118.33	Ea 2 @ per pack	\$97.90
Lines, White, 1 Foot Wide, 3 Foot Long, 125 Mil	Ea	NA	Ea	\$11.35	Ea 10 @ per pack	\$9.41
Lines, White, 1 Foot Wide, 30 Foot Long, 125 Mil	Roll	NA	Roll	\$120.00	Roll 2 @ per pack	\$98.84
Lines, White, 2 Foot Wide, 3 Foot Long, 125 Mil	Ea	NA	Ea	\$22.70	Ea 5 @ per pack	\$18.76
Lines, White, 2 Foot Wide, 30 Foot Long, 125 Mil	Roll	NA	Roll	\$240.00	Roll	\$197.56
<p>This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award</p>						