

Bid 14-21
Sign Post, Brackets, and Barricades

Company	MD Solutions	ISA Traffic Products	Little Enterprises of Ohio, LLC	Vulcan Sign
Stainless Steel Brackets for Strapping to Round Post	\$0.99	\$0.99	\$3.35	\$3.35
Wing Bracket 24"x8.25"x2" 3/4" X .020 Thick X20'	\$10.85	\$14.50	\$11.58	\$13.34
Stainless Steel Strapping 3/4" X Wing Clip	\$44.00	\$89.75	\$51.20	\$162.45
SS Bracket w/boots&washers/16ththread hole & 3/4"banding	\$0.16	\$0.52	\$29.85	\$0.65
8 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$993.00	\$778.50	\$1.50	\$4.16
10 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,225.00	\$935.00	No Bid	\$893.00
12 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,485.00	\$1,160.00	No Bid	\$1,116.00
3 Ft By 2.25 In by 2.25 In, 12 Gauge	\$597.50	\$407.50	No Bid	\$1,305.00
30" Barricades	No Bid	\$39.50	\$41.00	\$496.50
30" Barricades With Flashers And Battery	No Bid	\$57.50	\$59.50	\$75.14
Batteries For Barricades	No Bid	\$2.45	\$2.75	\$111.00
12" Cornes	No Bid	\$6.50	\$5.50	\$1.75
18" Cornes	No Bid	\$8.50	\$10.20	\$4.93
28" Cornes	No Bid	\$11.50	\$13.60	\$6.59
Trim-Line Channelizers with 15 Lb Base	No Bid	\$31.15	\$26.80	\$1.95
				\$37.44

This is a list of the bid responses received, and is provided for informational purposes only. This is not a Notice of Bid Award.