

Bid 14-029
Concrete Pipe

Company		County Materials				
Pipe Diameter	Flared Ends - Class 3 (\$ per section)	Class 3 (\$ per ft)	Class 4 (\$ per ft)	Class 5 (\$ per ft)	Approx. # per ft	Length Per Joint
12"	\$300.00	NA	\$9.00	\$12.35	104	8
15"	\$390.00	\$11.70	\$12.60	\$17.40	146	8
18"	\$435.00	\$15.00	\$18.00	\$22.35	188	8
21"	\$445.00	\$18.50	\$20.40	\$28.20	236	8
24"	\$500.00	\$22.75	\$24.50	\$33.75	283	8
27"	\$600.00	\$27.75	\$29.85	\$41.15	346	8
30"	\$750.00	\$32.55	\$34.95	\$48.25	405	8
36"	\$850.00	\$43.50	\$46.80	\$64.50	542	8
42"	\$1,125.00	\$67.20	\$72.15	\$99.50	836	8
48"	\$1,430.00	\$71.55	\$81.75	\$137.00	890	8
54"	\$1,800.00	\$102.00	\$117.00	\$196.50	1270	8
60"	\$2,600.00	\$120.00	\$140.00	\$235.00	1530	8
GASKET JOINT (NON-REINFORCED)						
Pipe Diameter	Flared Ends - Class 3 (\$ per section)	Class 3 (\$ per ft)	Class 4 (\$ per ft)	Class 5 (\$ per ft)	Approx. # per ft	Length Per Joint
12"	\$300.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
15"	\$390.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
18"	\$435.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Gasket joint lubricant 3-gallon pail		\$40.00	for 2.5 gallons			
Delivery charge per minimum load		\$600.00				
Minimum load quantity		1/2 truck				