

Bid 14-031  
Plastic Pipe

Company		Boehmer Brothers								
Item Num	Pipe Size (OD/ID) (in) PIPE LINER A/1/OD	List Pipe Thickness	List Deflection	Price per (\$/ft)	List Pipe Thickness	List Deflection	Price per (\$/ft)	List Pipe Thickness	List Deflection	Price per (\$/ft)
1	12			No Bid						
2	15			No Bid						
3	18			No Bid						
4	21			No Bid						
5	24			No Bid						
6	30			No Bid						
7	36			No Bid						
8	40			No Bid						
9	48			No Bid						
10	60			No Bid						
11	List:			No Bid						
	HDPE (Black)									
12	12			\$4.83						
13	15			\$6.65						
14	18			\$8.92						
15	21			NO BID						
16	24			\$14.40						
17	30			\$22.10						
18	36			\$26.50						
19	40			NO BID						
20	48			\$44.05						
21	60			\$73.95						
22	List: 42			\$37.50						
	HDPE (Gray)									
23	12			\$8.65						
24	15			\$8.85						
25	18			\$11.05						
26	21			NO BID						
27	24			\$16.75						
28	30			\$26.45						
29	36			\$33.45						
30	40			NO BID						
31	48			\$55.70						
32	60			\$92.00						
33	List: 42			\$48.20						