

Bid 13-006
 Sign Post, Brackets, and Barricades

Company	Custom Products		J&A Traffic Products		Schulte Supply		American Sign Brackets	
Brackets For Extruded Street Signs	4"	12"	4"	12"	4"	12"	4"	12"
Round To Blade		\$8.98		\$10.50		\$15.79		\$12.40
Channel To Blade		\$8.98		\$10.50		\$15.79		\$12.40
Blade To Blade		\$9.50		\$10.50		\$15.79		\$12.40
	Post > 4"	Post < 4"	Post > 4"	Post < 4"	Post > 4"	Post < 4"	Post > 4"	Post < 4"
Stainless Steel Brackets for Strapping to Round Post	\$1.19	\$1.19	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
Galvanized "Perforated Square" Posts	Price Each Per Bundle of 50		Price Each Per Bundle of 50		Price Each Per Bundle of 50		Price Each Per Bundle of 50	
8 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,080.00		\$778.50		\$1,440.00		No bid	
10 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,350.00		\$935.00		\$1,800.00		No bid	
12 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,620.00		\$1,160.00		\$2,160.00		No bid	
3 Ft By 2.25 In by 2.25 In, 12 Gauge	\$609.00		\$407.50		\$864.50		No bid	
2" cap flat blade for square post 90 degrees (each price)	\$9.25		\$10.50		\$15.79		\$4.56	
Wing Bracket 24" X 8.25" X 2"	\$16.89		No bid		\$31.89		No bid	
3/4" X .020 Thick X 200' stainless Steel Strapping	\$55.83		No bid		\$115.00		No bid	
3/4" X Wing Clip	\$0.66		No bid		\$65.00		No bid	
SS Bracket w/bolt & washer 5/16 thread hole and 3/4" banding (secures to >4" O.D. post)	\$9.07		No bid		\$200.00		No bid	
Traffic Delineators								
30" Barricades	\$51.00		\$37.15		\$48.03		No bid	
30" Barricades w/ flashers & Battery	\$73.78		\$59.20		\$71.32		No bid	
Batteries for Barricades	\$3.14		\$2.35		\$2.25		No bid	
12" Cones	\$6.54		\$6.25		3.39		No bid	
18" Cones	\$5.13		\$7.45		4.89		No bid	
28" Cones	\$8.33		\$11.30		8.59		No bid	
Trim-Line Channelizers with 16 Lb Base	\$33.60		\$34.05		31.39		No bid	

Bid 13-006

Sign Post, Brackets, and Barricades

Company	MD Solutions		Lightle Enterprises of Ohio LLC	
Brackets For Extruded Street Signs	4"	12"	4"	12"
Round To Blade		\$7.85		\$7.76
Channel To Blade		\$7.85		\$7.29
Blade To Blade		\$7.85		\$8.72
	Post > 4'	Post < 4'	Post > 4'	Post < 4'
Stainless Steel Brackets for Strapping to Round Post	No bid	No bid	\$1.04	\$1.04
Galvanized "Perforated Square" Posts	Price Each Per Bundle of 50		Price Each Per Bundle of 50	
8 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$980.00		\$1,010.00	
10 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,195.00		\$1,262.50	
12 Ft By 2 In by 2 In, 14 Gauge	\$1,930.00		\$1,515.00	
3 Ft By 2.25 In by 2.25 In, 12 Gauge	\$597.50		\$745.00	
2" cap flat blade for square post 90 degrees (each price)	\$7.85		\$11.06	
Wing Bracket 24" X 8.25" X 2"	\$10.95		\$10.91	
3/4" X .020 Thick X 200' stainless Steel Strapping	\$44.00		\$52.11	
3/4" X Wing Clip	\$0.16		16.70 (per 100)	
SS Bracket w/bolt & washer 5/16 thread hole and 3/4" banding (secures to >4" O.D. post)	\$1.05		\$1.30	
Traffic Delineators				
30" Barricades	No Bid		No Bid	
30" Barricades w/Flashers and Battery	No Bid		No Bid	
Batteries for Barricades	No Bid		\$2.80	
12" Cones	No Bid		\$4.40	
18" Cones	No Bid		\$5.92	
28" Cones	No Bid		\$9.30	
Trim-Line Channelizers with 15 Lb. Base	No Bid		\$26.50	