

**Bid 13-015  
Concrete Pipe**

Company		BECO Concrete Products					
Pipe Diameter	Flared Ends - Class 3 (\$ per section)	Class 3 (\$ per ft)	Class 4 (\$ per ft)	Class 5 (\$ per ft)	Approx. # per ft	Length Per Joint	
12"	\$200.00	\$7.13	\$7.13	\$7.13	96	7.5	
15"	\$225.00	\$8.99	\$8.99	\$9.37	135	7.5	
18"	\$245.00	\$11.95	\$12.10	\$12.35	180	7.5	
21"	\$315.00	\$14.65	\$15.00	\$15.47	221	7.5	
24"	\$335.00	\$17.30	\$19.27	\$21.31	278	7.5	
27"	\$435.00	\$21.07	\$22.39	\$31.24	335	7.5	
30"	\$475.00	\$24.83	\$27.04	\$36.57	399	7.5	
36"	\$775.00	\$35.31	\$39.08	\$45.87	650	7.5	
42"	\$900.00	\$48.72	\$55.09	\$65.81	702	7.5	
48"	\$1,105.00	\$59.30	\$66.05	\$79.18	885	7.5	
54"	\$1,325.00	\$75.82	\$84.27	\$96.61	1125	8	
60"	\$1,785.00	\$91.90	\$106.46	\$127.08	1300	8	
<b>GASKET JOINT (NON-REINFORCED)</b>							
Pipe Diameter	Flared Ends - Class 3 (\$ per section)	Class 3 (\$ per ft)	Class 4 (\$ per ft)	Class 5 (\$ per ft)	Approx. # per ft	Length Per Joint	
12"	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
15"	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
18"	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Gasket joint lubricant 3-gallon pail \$40.60 for 2.5 gallons							
Delivery charge per minimum load \$0.00							
Minimum load quantity Truckload							

**Bid 13-015  
Concrete Pipe**

Company		County Materials Corp.					
Pipe Diameter	Flared Ends - Class 3 (\$ per section)	Class 3 (\$ per ft)	Class 4 (\$ per ft)	Class 5 (\$ per ft)	Approx. # per ft	Length Per Joint	
12"	\$218.00		\$6.75	\$7.00	424	8	
15"	\$235.00	\$8.90	\$9.00	\$9.95	336	8	
18"	\$250.00	\$13.00	\$13.20	\$14.60	256	8	
21"	\$320.00	\$15.50	\$16.00	\$17.00	200	8	
24"	\$345.00	\$18.00	\$18.95	\$21.00	160	8	
27"	\$400.00	\$23.80	\$25.10	\$29.70	136	8	
30"	\$480.00	\$26.00	\$27.80	\$31.45	112	8	
36"	\$600.00	\$37.50	\$41.40	\$52.95	80	8	
42"	\$700.00	\$49.00	\$56.60	\$67.10	56	8	
48"	\$800.00	\$59.00	\$66.50	\$81.00	48	8	
54"	\$1,495.00	\$82.00	\$90.00	\$104.00	32	8	
60"	\$1,700.00	\$120.00	\$136.00	\$150.00	32	8	
<b>GASKET JOINT (NON-REINFORCED)</b>							
Pipe Diameter	Flared Ends - Class 3 (\$ per section)	Class 3 (\$ per ft)	Class 4 (\$ per ft)	Class 5 (\$ per ft)	Approx. # per ft	Length Per Joint	
12"	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
15"	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
18"	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Gasket joint lubricant 3-gallon pail		\$40.00					
Delivery charge per minimum load		\$500.00					
Minimum load quantity		1/2 a load	or under				